
APRIL 25, 2022 - 7:00 PM

AGENDA
AVIATION COMMITTEE

PURSUANT TO RESOLUTION NO. 08-100, RULES I, II, AND III

I. COMMUNICATIONS

II. RESOLUTIONS, MOTIONS, AND NOTICES

1. Resolution authorizing application for and acceptance of US Department of Transportation
Federal Aviation Administration Grant on behalf of the Elmira Corning Regional Airport
(Modifications to Outbound Baggage Belt)

2. Resolution awarding bid to Tracey Road Equipment on behalf of the Elmira Corning Regional
Airport (RFB-2409, Airport Snow Removal Equipment)

3. Resolution awarding bid to Dalrymple Gravel & Contracting, Co., Inc. on behalf of the Elmira
Corning Regional Airport (RFB-2398, Reconstruction of Taxiway A)

4. Resolution authorizing Promotional Partner Agreement with Watkins Glen International on behalf
of the Elmira Corning Regional Airport

5. Resolution extending agreement with Sheen & Shine, Inc on behalf of the Elmira Corning Regional
Airport (RFB-2064-R Interior and Exterior Cleaning of Terminal Windows)

6. Resolution extending agreement with Retterer & Sons on behalf of the Elmira Corning Regional
Airport (RFB-2064-R Custodial Services, Terminal Building)

7. Resolution authorizing Task Order No. 22 with McFarland Johnson on behalf of the Elmira
Corning Regional Airport (Reconstruct Taxiway A Construction Administration Project)

8. Resolution authorizing Purchase Agreement with Hillyard, Inc. on behalf of the Elmira Corning
Regional Airport (Ride-on Sweeper)

9. Resolution authorizing Purchase Agreement with Deer & Company and CNH Industries of
America, LLC on behalf of the Elmira Corning Regional Airport (Tractor and Flail)

10. Resolution authorizing Purchase Agreement with Deer & Company and CNH Industries of
America, LLC on behalf of the  Elmira Corning Regional Airport (Case Excavator)

III. OLD BUSINESS

IV. NEW BUSINESS

1. Tom Freeman, Director of Aviation - Update on ECRA

V. ADJOURNMENT



 

CHEMUNG COUNTY ROUTE SLIP * PERSONNEL REQUISITION

 Resolution authorizing application for and acceptance of US Department of Transportation Federal
Aviation Administration Grant on behalf of the Elmira Corning Regional Airport (Modifications to
Outbound Baggage Belt)

Resolution #:
Slip Type: CONTRACT
SEQRA status
State Mandated False

Explain action needed or Position requested (justification):
Requesting resolution requesting to apply and accept an FAA grant for the Outbound Baggage Belt on
behalf of the Elmira Corning Regional Airport (ECRA).    This project involves modifications of the
current baggage belt system conveying checked bags from the airline ticket counters to the bag screening
area.  The estimated cost of this project is $2,750,000 (95% federal - $2,612,500 and 5% local -
$137,500).  The local share is to be paid for by Passenger Facility Charges (PFCs).

 Vendor/Provider FAA    
 Term Total Amount $2,750,00 Prior Amount
 Local Share 5% (PFC's) State Share Federal Share 95%
 Project

Budgeted?
Yes Funds are in

Account #
  

CREATION:
Date/Time: Department:
4/1/2022 2:35:16 PM County Executive

APPROVALS:
Date/Time: Approval: Department:
4/1/2022 2:36 PM Approved County Executive
4/4/2022 11:19 AM Approved Budget and Research
4/11/2022 11:24 AM Approved Legislature Chairman

ATTACHMENTS:
Name: Description: Type:

Outbound_Baggage_Apply_Accept.pdf Outbound Baggage Apply Accept Cover Memo
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file:///C:/Windows/AgendaPublic/AttachmentViewer.aspx?AttachmentID=20459&ItemID=19665
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CHEMUNG COUNTY ROUTE SLIP * PERSONNEL REQUISITION

 Resolution awarding bid to Tracey Road Equipment on behalf of the Elmira Corning Regional Airport
(RFB-2409, Airport Snow Removal Equipment)

Resolution #:
Slip Type: CONTRACT
SEQRA status
State Mandated False

Explain action needed or Position requested (justification):
The Director of Aviation, on behalf of the Elmira Corning Regional Airport, is requesting awarding the
bid to Tracey Road (Osh Kosh) for RFB-2409, Airport Snow Removal Equipment.  The base bid is
$1,066,284.00.

M-B Company is low bid at $958,365.00, however, they fail to meet specifications.  A detailed email
from the Director of Aviation is attached.  This request to reject the low bid has been reviewed and
approved by the County Attorney (see attached).

 Vendor/Provider Tracey Road Equipment    
 Term Total Amount $1,066,284 Prior Amount
 Local Share 5% (PFC's) State Share Federal Share 95%
 Project

Budgeted?
Yes Funds are in

Account #
  

CREATION:
Date/Time: Department:
4/7/2022 11:33:27 AM County Executive

APPROVALS:
Date/Time: Approval: Department:
4/7/2022 11:37 AM Approved County Executive
4/7/2022 3:44 PM Approved Budget and Research
4/11/2022 11:14 AM Approved Legislature Chairman

ATTACHMENTS:
Name: Description: Type:

 RFB-2409_SRE.pdf RFB-2409 SRE Cover Memo

 

STAMP_ITEMNUMBER

file:///C:/Windows/AgendaPublic/AttachmentViewer.aspx?AttachmentID=20595&ItemID=19743


 SRE_Email.pdf SRE Email Cover Memo
 Copy_of_RFB-

2409_Airport_Snow_Removal_Equipment_Bid_Tab.pdf
Bid Tab Cover Memo

 

STAMP_ITEMNUMBER

file:///C:/Windows/AgendaPublic/AttachmentViewer.aspx?AttachmentID=20596&ItemID=19743
file:///C:/Windows/AgendaPublic/AttachmentViewer.aspx?AttachmentID=20616&ItemID=19743


STAMP_ITEMNUMBER



STAMP_ITEMNUMBER
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Bidders: Tracey Road 
Fort brand Services 

LLC *
M-B Companies Inc **

Addendum #1 Received Received Received

Description

Base Bid 1,066,284.00 1,108,300.00 958,365.00

Alternate #1: Spare Brush Core 14,400.00 33,600.00 9,351.00

Alternate #2: Spare Plow Cutting Edge 3,300.00 6,566.00 1,971.00

Alternate #3: Brush Carts 4,500.00 3,797.00 858.00

Alternate #4: Maintenance Training 5,000.00 7,875.00 4,550.00

Alternate #5: Airport Decals Install 1,800.00 No Charge 921.00

Alternate #6 3,451.00 3,000.00 5,502.00

1,098,735.00 1,163,138.00 981,518.00

* No Seal on Waiver of Immunity, Unable to open some of tabs on Electronic Submission

CHEMUNG COUNTY-CITY OF ELMIRA PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

RFB-2409

Airport Snow Removal Equipment

 

Bid Opening:  March 31, 2022

STAMP_ITEMNUMBER



** No Seal on Waiver of Immunity
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CHEMUNG COUNTY ROUTE SLIP * PERSONNEL REQUISITION

 Resolution awarding bid to Dalrymple Gravel & Contracting, Co., Inc. on behalf of the Elmira Corning
Regional Airport (RFB-2398, Reconstruction of Taxiway A)

Resolution #:
Slip Type: CONTRACT
SEQRA status
State Mandated False

Explain action needed or Position requested (justification):
The Director of Aviation, on behalf of the Elmira Corning Regional Airport, is requesting authorization to
award the bid to Dalrymple Gravel and Contracting for RFB-2398, Reconstruction of Taxiway A.  The
total gross sum bid is $1,538,665.

 Vendor/Provider Dalrymple Gravel and
Contracting

   

 Term Total Amount $1,538,665 Prior Amount
 Local Share 5% (PFC's) State Share Federal Share 95%
 Project

Budgeted?
Yes Funds are in

Account #
  

CREATION:
Date/Time: Department:
4/7/2022 1:29:03 PM County Executive

APPROVALS:
Date/Time: Approval: Department:
4/7/2022 1:34 PM Approved County Executive
4/7/2022 3:44 PM Approved Budget and Research
4/11/2022 11:10 AM Approved Legislature Chairman

ATTACHMENTS:
Name: Description: Type:

 RFB-2398.pdf RFB-2398 Cover Memo
 Bid_Tab_-_RFB-2398_Reconstruct_Taxiway_A.pdf Bid Tab Cover Memo
 ELM_Reconstruct_TW_A_-

_Construction_Award_Recommendation_to_Chemung_County_Pkg.pdf
Construction Award Recommendation Cover Memo
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file:///C:/Windows/AgendaPublic/AttachmentViewer.aspx?AttachmentID=20599&ItemID=19752
file:///C:/Windows/AgendaPublic/AttachmentViewer.aspx?AttachmentID=20684&ItemID=19752
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April 4, 2022 
 
Mr. Thomas Freeman 
Director of Aviation 
Elmira Corning Regional Airport 
276 Sing Sing Road, Suite 1 
Horseheads, New York 14845 
 
Re: Construction Award Recommendation 

Elmira Corning Regional Airport 
Reconstruct Taxiway A 
FAA AIP No. 3-36-0026-075-2021 

 
Dear Mr. Freeman: 
 
Two bids for the above referenced project were received on April 1, 2022, with the low bid submitted by 
Dalrymple Gravel & Contracting Co., Inc., 2105 South Broadway, Pine City, NY 14871. The bid was as 
follows: 
 

1. Dalrymple Gravel & Contracting Co., Inc.    $1,538,665.00 

2. Rifenburg Construction, Inc.       $1,920,115.00 
 
The certified bid tabulations are attached and have been reviewed and found to be in order. Based on the 
contractor’s qualifications and experience on similar projects at Elmira Corning Regional Airport, we 
are recommending award of the construction contract in the amount of $1,538,665.00 to:  
 

Dalrymple Gravel & Contracting Co., Inc. 
2105 South Broadway 
Pine City, NY 14871 
Phone: (607) 737-6200 
Fax: (607) 767-0841 
 

If you have any questions or require any additional information, please do not hesitate to contact this 
office. 
 
Sincerely, 
McFarland-Johnson, Inc. 

 
Jared P. Moore, P.E. 
Project Engineer 

STAMP_ITEMNUMBER
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Enclosures 
 
cc: Matthew Brown (ELM) 

Jeff Wood (MJ) 
Kelli Walters (MJ) 

STAMP_ITEMNUMBER



Unit of Estimated

Measure Quantity Unit Price Total Value Unit Price Total Value Unit Price Total Value

C-100-1 CONTRACTOR'S QUALITY CONTROL PROGRAM (CQCP) LS 1 14,000.00$                     14,000.00$               2,000.00$                       2,000.00$                 168,000.00$                   168,000.00$              

C-102-25 DRAINAGE STRUCTURE INLET PROTECTION, SILT FENCE-TEMPORARY LF 210 10.00$                            2,100.00$                 9.00$                              1,890.00$                 10.00$                            2,100.00$                 

C-105-1 MOBILIZATION (3% MAX) LS 1 39,775.50$                     39,775.50$               40,000.00$                     40,000.00$               55,500.00$                     55,500.00$               

C-105-2 ENGINEER'S FIELD OFFICE LS 1 14,100.00$                     14,100.00$               12,000.00$                     12,000.00$               7,500.00$                       7,500.00$                 

M-120-1 MAINTENANCE AND PROTECTION OF TRAFFIC LS 1 100,000.00$                   100,000.00$              130,000.00$                   130,000.00$              235,737.00$                   235,737.00$              

M-120-2 LOW-PROFILE CONSTRUCTION BARRICADES EA 34 250.00$                          8,500.00$                 160.00$                          5,440.00$                 117.00$                          3,978.00$                 

M-120-5 FABRIC CLOSURE MARKER - TAXIWAY EA 1 3,000.00$                       3,000.00$                 7,500.00$                       7,500.00$                 1,550.00$                       1,550.00$                 

M-150-1 PROJECT SURVEY AND STAKEOUT LS 1 50,000.00$                     50,000.00$               55,000.00$                     55,000.00$               32,000.00$                     32,000.00$               

P-100-1 GEOXTILE STABILIZATION FABRIC SY 9,800 2.00$                              19,600.00$               2.50$                              24,500.00$               1.00$                              9,800.00$                 

P-101-1 PAVEMENT REMOVAL SY 9,400 4.00$                              37,600.00$               8.00$                              75,200.00$               7.50$                              70,500.00$               

P-101-3 MISCELLANEOUS COLD MILLING SY 50 40.00$                            2,000.00$                 13.00$                            650.00$                    21.00$                            1,050.00$                 

P-152-1 UNCLASSIFIED EXCAVATION CY 5,600 10.00$                            56,000.00$               15.00$                            84,000.00$               18.00$                            100,800.00$              

P-152-4 UNDERCUT EXCAVATION AND BACKFILL CY 560 60.00$                            33,600.00$               17.00$                            9,520.00$                 78.00$                            43,680.00$               

P-209-1 CRUSHED AGGREGATE BASE COURSE CY 6,350 60.00$                            381,000.00$              55.00$                            349,250.00$              73.00$                            463,550.00$              

P-401-1 ASPHALT SURFACE COURSE TON 2,400 100.00$                          240,000.00$              125.00$                          300,000.00$              123.00$                          295,200.00$              

P-401-2 ASPHALT BINDER COURSE TON 3,100 95.00$                            294,500.00$              110.00$                          341,000.00$              112.00$                          347,200.00$              

P-603-1 BITUMINOUS TACK COAT GAL 1,960 2.50$                              4,900.00$                 4.50$                              8,820.00$                 8.00$                              15,680.00$               

P-605-1 JOINT SEALING FILLER LF 390 5.00$                              1,950.00$                 13.00$                            5,070.00$                 10.50$                            4,095.00$                 

P-620-3 YELLOW PAVEMENT MARKINGS SF 1,200 4.00$                              4,800.00$                 7.10$                              8,520.00$                 6.00$                              7,200.00$                 

P-620-6 TEMPORARY YELLOW PAVEMENT MARKINGS SF 1,200 2.00$                              2,400.00$                 7.10$                              8,520.00$                 6.00$                              7,200.00$                 

P-620-7 PREFORMED THERMOPLASTIC PAVEMENT MARKINGS SF 430 35.00$                            15,050.00$               34.50$                            14,835.00$               40.00$                            17,200.00$               

D-700-2 INFILTRATION TRENCH LS 1 35,000.00$                     35,000.00$               50,000.00$                     50,000.00$               26,000.00$                     26,000.00$               

T-901-1 HYDROSEEDING ACRE 0.30 2,500.00$                       750.00$                    5,500.00$                       1,650.00$                 2,250.00$                       675.00$                    

T-905-2 TOPSOILING (OBTAINED ON SITE) CY 110 40.00$                            4,400.00$                 15.00$                            1,650.00$                 29.50$                            3,245.00$                 

T-908-1 MULCHING ACRE 0.30 2,000.00$                       600.00$                    5,500.00$                       1,650.00$                 2,250.00$                       675.00$                    

TOTAL BASE BID 1,365,625.50$           TOTAL BASE BID 1,538,665.00$           TOTAL BASE BID 1,920,115.00$           

Jared P. Moore, P.E.

39,775.50$               44,959.95$               55,938.45$               

MAX 3% MOB. MAX 3% MOB. MAX 3% MOB.

OK OK OK

McFarland-Johnson, Inc. Dalrymple Gravel & Contracting Co., Inc. Rifenburg Construction, Inc.

Binghamton, NY 13901 Pine City, NY 14871 Troy, NY 12180

49 Court Street, Suite 240 2105 South Broadway 159 Brick Church Road

This is to certify that this document represents the bids received on Friday April 1, 2022 and that the bids received have been reviewed thoroughly.

Item No. Description
Engineer's Estimate Contractor 1

BASE BID

Contractor 2

Elmira Corning Regional Airport - Horseheads, NY

MJ Project No. 18302.16
Chemung County RFB-2398

FAA AIP 3-36-0026-075-2021

Reconstruct Taxiway A

Friday, April 1, 2022
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CHEMUNG COUNTY ROUTE SLIP * PERSONNEL REQUISITION

 Resolution authorizing Promotional Partner Agreement with Watkins Glen International on behalf of the
Elmira Corning Regional Airport

Resolution #:
Slip Type: OTHER
SEQRA status
State Mandated False

Explain action needed or Position requested (justification):
The Director of Aviation, on behalf of the Elmira Corning Regional Airport, is requesting authorization of
an advertising agreement with Watkins Glen International.  The cost is $10,600 paid for by the SCASDP
grant.

The anticipated events for 2022 are as follows:
- IMSA WeatherTech SportsCar Championship (June 24-26)
- Finger Lakes Wine Festival (July 8-10)
- GT World Challenge (July 22-24
- ARCA Menards Series, NASCAR XFINITY Series & NASCAR Cup Series (August 19-21)
- Hilliard US Vintage Grand Prix (September 9-11)

ELM will receive:
- being named as the Preferred Airport of Watkins Glen International
- logo and banner of WGI website 
- 4 social media posts on platforms prior to each major event weekend
- a mutually agreed upon number of thirty second (:30) public address announcements/day during each
major event weekend
- twenty (20) Drive the Glen passes
- on-site signage

CREATION:
Date/Time: Department:
4/7/2022 1:36:29 PM County Executive

APPROVALS:
Date/Time: Approval: Department:
4/7/2022 1:51 PM Approved County Executive
4/7/2022 3:42 PM Approved Budget and Research
4/11/2022 9:42 AM Approved Legislature Chairman
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ATTACHMENTS:
Name: Description: Type:

 WGI_Agreement.pdf Agreement Cover Memo
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CHEMUNG COUNTY ROUTE SLIP * PERSONNEL REQUISITION

 Resolution extending agreement with Sheen & Shine, Inc on behalf of the Elmira Corning Regional
Airport (RFB-2064-R Interior and Exterior Cleaning of Terminal Windows)

Resolution #:
Slip Type: OTHER
SEQRA status
State Mandated False

Explain action needed or Position requested (justification):
The Director of Aviation, on behalf of the Elmira Corning Regional Airport is requesting authorization to
extend the Sheen and Shine, Inc. agreement authorized by 19-416 for the interior and exterior cleaning of
the terminal windows.  This will be the third of three (3), one (1) year extensions until 3/31/23 under the
same terms and conditions.  The cost per cleaning is $6,588 or $13,176 annually (on or about April and
October).

CREATION:
Date/Time: Department:
4/7/2022 1:57:23 PM County Executive

APPROVALS:
Date/Time: Approval: Department:
4/7/2022 2:40 PM Approved County Executive
4/7/2022 3:43 PM Approved Budget and Research
4/11/2022 11:02 AM Approved Legislature Chairman

ATTACHMENTS:
Name: Description: Type:

 Copy_of_RFB-2064-
R_Custodial_Services_Elmira_Corning_Regional_Airport_Terminal_Bid_Tab.pdf

RFB-2064-R Custodial Services ECRA Cover Memo

 

 

STAMP_ITEMNUMBER

file:///C:/Windows/AgendaPublic/AttachmentViewer.aspx?AttachmentID=20602&ItemID=19754


Bidder

Addenda 1 & 2

Bid Item #1                                                                                         

Terminal Cleaning Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3

Total Monthly Cost $19,318.00 $20,025.00 $20,729.00 $21,435.00 $33,559.88 $34,379.19 $35,428.40 $36,792.18 $30,110.00 $35,020.00 $36,000.00 $37,070.00 $33,540.00 $35,100.00 $36,660.00

Total Annual Cost $231,826.00 $240,292.00 $248,758.00 $257,223.00 $402,718.55 $412,550.27 $425,140.84 $441,506.15 $361,320.00 $420,240.00 $432,000.00 $444,840.00 $330,365.60 $353,685.02 $377,019.68

Total # Cleaner Hours/Month 1,061 1,061 1,061 1,061 903 903 903 903 1,060 1,060 1,060 1,060 953.33 953.33 953.33

Total # Supervisor Hours/Month 243 243 243 243 121 121 121 121 125 125 125 125 606.67 606.67 606.67

Total # of Employees Required to Perform Work 10 10 10 10 7 7 7 7 8 8 8 8 10 10 10

Bid Item #1 Grand Total (Year 1 - 4)

Bid Item #2                                                                                             

Cleaning of all Windows Interior & Exterior                                

(Refer to bid document specifications for size and qty)                                                                                                   

Total Cost

Bidder

Addenda 1 & 2

Bid Item #1                                                                                         

Terminal Cleaning Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3

Total Monthly Cost $27,396.00 $27,990.00 $29,180.00 $30,380.00 $22,892.00 $23,350.00 $24,051.00 $25,013.00 $27,649.00 $27,925.00 $28,204.00 $28,487.00 $119,342.19 $20,847.13 $20,847.13

Total Annual Cost $328,752.00 $335,880.00 $350,160.00 $364,560.00 $274,704.00 $280,200.00 $288,612.00 $300,156.00 $331,790.00 $335,108.00 $338,459.00 $341,844.00 $236,990.13 $250,165.53 $250,165.53

Total # Cleaner Hours/Month 909 909 909 909 887 887 887 887 800 800 800 800 939 939 939

Total # Supervisor Hours/Month 138 138 138 138 174 174 174 174 120 120 120 120 145 145 145

Total # of Employees Required to Perform Work 7 7 7 7 9 9 9 9 6 6 6 6 10 10 10

Bid Item #1 Grand Total (Year 1 - 4)

Bid Item #2                                                                                             

Cleaning of all Windows Interior & Exterior                                

(Refer to bid document specifications for size and qty)                                                                                                   

Total Cost

$1,347,201.00

Acknowledged Addendum #1 Only Acknowledged Addendum #1 Only Acknowledged Addenda #1 and #2

No Bid $2,772.00 $12,000.00

$14,120.00

Did Not Acknowledge Addendum # 1 or #2

$978,099.00

$30,000.00

CHEMUNG COUNTY-CITY OF ELMIRA PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

RFB-2064-R

Re-Bid Custodial Services, Elmira Corning Regional Airport Terminal

Bid Opening:  February 7, 2019

Retterer & Sons Greenstar Services, Inc. Duran Cleaning Services D & R Cleaning, Inc.

$1,681,915.81 $1,658,400.00 $1,722,240.00

$60,564.18 No Bid

No Bid

Acknowledged Addenda #1 and #2 Acknowledged Addenda #1 and #2 Acknowledged Addenda #1 and #2 Acknowledged Addenda #1 and #2

Interstate Maintenance Pure Environment Maintenance, Inc.GDI Services, Inc. Atalian Global Services

$1,379,352.00 $1,143,672.00 $987,486.72

Page 1 of 4
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Bidder

Addenda 1 & 2

Bid Item #1                                                                                         

Terminal Cleaning Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4

Total Monthly Cost $21,513.37 $22,158.77 $22,823.53 $23,508.23 $51,345.00 $54,431.00 $55,048.00 $56,177.00

Total Annual Cost $258,164.44 $265,905.25 $273,882.40 $282,098.87 $616,147.00 $653,172.00 $660,583.00 $674,128.00

Total # Cleaner Hours/Month 909.3 909.3 909.3 909.3 2,311 2,311 2,311 2,311

Total # Supervisor Hours/Month 60.62 60.62 60.62 60.62 174 174 174 174

Total # of Employees Required to Perform Work 6 6 6 6 18 18 18 18

Bid Item #1 Grand Total (Year 1 - 4)

Bid Item #2                                                                                             

Cleaning of all Windows Interior & Exterior                                

(Refer to bid document specifications for size and qty)                                                                                                   

Total Cost

13176

No Bid$6,588.00 No Bid

$1,080,050.90 No Bid $2,604,030.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Acknowledged Addenda #1 and #2 No Bid Acknowledged Addenda #1 and #2

Sheen and Shine, Inc. SKJ Facilities Management, Inc. Superior Building Maintenance

CHEMUNG COUNTY-CITY OF ELMIRA PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

RFB-2064-R

Re-Bid Custodial Services, Elmira Corning Regional Airport Terminal

Bid Opening:  February 7, 2019

Page 2 of 4
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Year 4

$38,220.00

$381,662.10

953.33

606.67

10

Year 4

$20,847.13

$250,165.53

939

145

10

Did Not Acknowledge Addendum # 1 or #2

CHEMUNG COUNTY-CITY OF ELMIRA PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

RFB-2064-R

Re-Bid Custodial Services, Elmira Corning Regional Airport Terminal

Bid Opening:  February 7, 2019

D & R Cleaning, Inc.

$1,722,240.00

No Bid

No Bid

Acknowledged Addenda #1 and #2

Pure Environment Maintenance, Inc.

$987,486.72

Page 3 of 4
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CHEMUNG COUNTY-CITY OF ELMIRA PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

RFB-2064-R

Re-Bid Custodial Services, Elmira Corning Regional Airport Terminal

Bid Opening:  February 7, 2019

Page 4 of 4
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CHEMUNG COUNTY ROUTE SLIP * PERSONNEL REQUISITION

 Resolution extending agreement with Retterer & Sons on behalf of the Elmira Corning Regional Airport
(RFB-2064-R Custodial Services, Terminal Building)

Resolution #:
Slip Type: OTHER
SEQRA status
State Mandated False

Explain action needed or Position requested (justification):
The Director of Aviation, on behalf of the Elmira Corning Regional Airport is requesting to extend the
Retterer & Sons agreement authorized by resolutions 19-230, 20-172, and 21-190.  This will be the 3rd of
three (3) one (1) year extensions until 3/31/23, under the same terms and conditions.  The monthly cost
for year four is $21,435 for $257,223 annually.

CREATION:
Date/Time: Department:
4/7/2022 2:43:11 PM County Executive

APPROVALS:
Date/Time: Approval: Department:
4/7/2022 2:46 PM Approved County Executive
4/7/2022 3:43 PM Approved Budget and Research
4/11/2022 11:01 AM Approved Legislature Chairman

ATTACHMENTS:
Name: Description: Type:

 Copy_of_RFB-2064-
R_Custodial_Services_Elmira_Corning_Regional_Airport_Terminal_Bid_Tab.pdf

RFB-2064-R Custodial Services Cover Memo
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Bidder

Addenda 1 & 2

Bid Item #1                                                                                         

Terminal Cleaning Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3

Total Monthly Cost $19,318.00 $20,025.00 $20,729.00 $21,435.00 $33,559.88 $34,379.19 $35,428.40 $36,792.18 $30,110.00 $35,020.00 $36,000.00 $37,070.00 $33,540.00 $35,100.00 $36,660.00

Total Annual Cost $231,826.00 $240,292.00 $248,758.00 $257,223.00 $402,718.55 $412,550.27 $425,140.84 $441,506.15 $361,320.00 $420,240.00 $432,000.00 $444,840.00 $330,365.60 $353,685.02 $377,019.68

Total # Cleaner Hours/Month 1,061 1,061 1,061 1,061 903 903 903 903 1,060 1,060 1,060 1,060 953.33 953.33 953.33

Total # Supervisor Hours/Month 243 243 243 243 121 121 121 121 125 125 125 125 606.67 606.67 606.67

Total # of Employees Required to Perform Work 10 10 10 10 7 7 7 7 8 8 8 8 10 10 10

Bid Item #1 Grand Total (Year 1 - 4)

Bid Item #2                                                                                             

Cleaning of all Windows Interior & Exterior                                

(Refer to bid document specifications for size and qty)                                                                                                   

Total Cost

Bidder

Addenda 1 & 2

Bid Item #1                                                                                         

Terminal Cleaning Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3

Total Monthly Cost $27,396.00 $27,990.00 $29,180.00 $30,380.00 $22,892.00 $23,350.00 $24,051.00 $25,013.00 $27,649.00 $27,925.00 $28,204.00 $28,487.00 $119,342.19 $20,847.13 $20,847.13

Total Annual Cost $328,752.00 $335,880.00 $350,160.00 $364,560.00 $274,704.00 $280,200.00 $288,612.00 $300,156.00 $331,790.00 $335,108.00 $338,459.00 $341,844.00 $236,990.13 $250,165.53 $250,165.53

Total # Cleaner Hours/Month 909 909 909 909 887 887 887 887 800 800 800 800 939 939 939

Total # Supervisor Hours/Month 138 138 138 138 174 174 174 174 120 120 120 120 145 145 145

Total # of Employees Required to Perform Work 7 7 7 7 9 9 9 9 6 6 6 6 10 10 10

Bid Item #1 Grand Total (Year 1 - 4)

Bid Item #2                                                                                             

Cleaning of all Windows Interior & Exterior                                

(Refer to bid document specifications for size and qty)                                                                                                   

Total Cost

$1,347,201.00

Acknowledged Addendum #1 Only Acknowledged Addendum #1 Only Acknowledged Addenda #1 and #2

No Bid $2,772.00 $12,000.00

$14,120.00

Did Not Acknowledge Addendum # 1 or #2

$978,099.00

$30,000.00

CHEMUNG COUNTY-CITY OF ELMIRA PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

RFB-2064-R

Re-Bid Custodial Services, Elmira Corning Regional Airport Terminal

Bid Opening:  February 7, 2019

Retterer & Sons Greenstar Services, Inc. Duran Cleaning Services D & R Cleaning, Inc.

$1,681,915.81 $1,658,400.00 $1,722,240.00

$60,564.18 No Bid

No Bid

Acknowledged Addenda #1 and #2 Acknowledged Addenda #1 and #2 Acknowledged Addenda #1 and #2 Acknowledged Addenda #1 and #2

Interstate Maintenance Pure Environment Maintenance, Inc.GDI Services, Inc. Atalian Global Services

$1,379,352.00 $1,143,672.00 $987,486.72

Page 1 of 4
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Bidder

Addenda 1 & 2

Bid Item #1                                                                                         

Terminal Cleaning Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4

Total Monthly Cost $21,513.37 $22,158.77 $22,823.53 $23,508.23 $51,345.00 $54,431.00 $55,048.00 $56,177.00

Total Annual Cost $258,164.44 $265,905.25 $273,882.40 $282,098.87 $616,147.00 $653,172.00 $660,583.00 $674,128.00

Total # Cleaner Hours/Month 909.3 909.3 909.3 909.3 2,311 2,311 2,311 2,311

Total # Supervisor Hours/Month 60.62 60.62 60.62 60.62 174 174 174 174

Total # of Employees Required to Perform Work 6 6 6 6 18 18 18 18

Bid Item #1 Grand Total (Year 1 - 4)

Bid Item #2                                                                                             

Cleaning of all Windows Interior & Exterior                                

(Refer to bid document specifications for size and qty)                                                                                                   

Total Cost

13176

No Bid$6,588.00 No Bid

$1,080,050.90 No Bid $2,604,030.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Acknowledged Addenda #1 and #2 No Bid Acknowledged Addenda #1 and #2

Sheen and Shine, Inc. SKJ Facilities Management, Inc. Superior Building Maintenance

CHEMUNG COUNTY-CITY OF ELMIRA PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

RFB-2064-R

Re-Bid Custodial Services, Elmira Corning Regional Airport Terminal

Bid Opening:  February 7, 2019

Page 2 of 4
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Year 4

$38,220.00

$381,662.10

953.33

606.67

10

Year 4

$20,847.13

$250,165.53

939

145

10

Did Not Acknowledge Addendum # 1 or #2

CHEMUNG COUNTY-CITY OF ELMIRA PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

RFB-2064-R

Re-Bid Custodial Services, Elmira Corning Regional Airport Terminal

Bid Opening:  February 7, 2019

D & R Cleaning, Inc.

$1,722,240.00

No Bid

No Bid

Acknowledged Addenda #1 and #2

Pure Environment Maintenance, Inc.

$987,486.72

Page 3 of 4
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CHEMUNG COUNTY-CITY OF ELMIRA PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

RFB-2064-R

Re-Bid Custodial Services, Elmira Corning Regional Airport Terminal

Bid Opening:  February 7, 2019

Page 4 of 4
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CHEMUNG COUNTY ROUTE SLIP * PERSONNEL REQUISITION

 Resolution authorizing Task Order No. 22 with McFarland Johnson on behalf of the Elmira Corning
Regional Airport (Reconstruct Taxiway A Construction Administration Project)

Resolution #:
Slip Type: CONTRACT
SEQRA status
State Mandated False

Explain action needed or Position requested (justification):
The Director of Aviation, on behalf of the Elmira Corning Regional Airport is requesting authorization of
McFarland Johnson's Task Order No. 22, Reconstruct Taxiway A Construction Administration Project.
 McFarland-Johnson, Inc. shall provide the following professional services to
Chemung County including administrative and full-time resident inspection services during the
Construction Phase of the above project. The project will be constructed by Chemung County with grant
assistance from the Federal Aviation Administration (FAA) Airport Improvement Program (AIP), and the
State of New York Department of Transportation. 

The cost of this Task Order is $165,747.00

 Vendor/Provider McFarland Johnson    
 Term Total Amount $165,747.00 Prior Amount
 Local Share 5% (PFC's) State Share 5% Federal Share 95% (FAA

Grant)
 Project

Budgeted?
Yes Funds are in

Account #
  

CREATION:
Date/Time: Department:
4/12/2022 11:48:47 AM County Executive

APPROVALS:
Date/Time: Approval: Department:
4/12/2022 11:50 AM Approved County Executive
4/13/2022 11:09 AM Approved Budget and Research
4/14/2022 1:15 PM Approved Legislature Chairman

ATTACHMENTS:
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Name: Description: Type:
 MJ_TO_22.pdf MJ Task Order No. 22 Cover Memo
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SCHEDULE A 
 
 TASK ORDER  
 AUTHORIZATION  
 NO. 22    
 
PROJECT:   Five -Year Consultant Services Contract  
    Elmira Corning Regional Airport 
    M-J Project No. 18302.22 
 
DATE OF ISSUANCE: April 1, 2022 
 
PROJECT DESCRIPTION: Reconstruct Taxiway A Construction Administration Project 
 
    The items of work to be accomplished under this Task Order include the following 

and are further described on the attached Scope of Work, “Exhibit “A”: 
 

 Project Administration / Management 
 Construction Administration 
 Construction Observation 
 Geotechnical Laboratory & Field Testing 
 As-built Topographical Surveying and Mapping  
 Grant Administration 

 
METHOD OF COMPENSATION: 
 
Cost-Plus Fixed Fee, as indicated in the attached Exhibit B  
 
 
THIS TASK ORDER NO. 22 AMOUNT   DAYS OR DATES TO COMPLETE THIS TASK ORDER 
 
$         165,747        December 31, 2023 
 
    
 
The Agreement for Professional Engineering Services between County of Chemung and McFarland-Johnson, Inc., for Professional Services at 
Elmira-Corning Regional Airport, five-year period, dated July 10, 2017, shall govern all TASK ORDERS executed under this Assignment, unless 
modified in writing and agreed to by CONSULTANT and SPONSOR. 
  
 
ACCEPTED:       APPROVED: 
 
by __________________________    by __________________________ 
 James M. Festa, P.E. Christopher J. Moss 
 Chief Executive Officer County Executive 
 
 

Resolution #     
Approval Date    
PIN #  Pending   
FAA AIP # 3-36-0026-XX-2022 
MJ Project #  18302.22  
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Elmira Corning Regional Airport   
Reconstruct Parallel Taxiway A 
Construction Administration – Scope of Services 1 

EXHIBIT “A” 

TASK ORDER NO. 22 
  

Scope of Work 
 

ELMIRA CORNING REGIONAL AIRPORT 
CHEMUNG COUNTY, NY 

 
CONSTRUCTION OBSERVATION AND ADMINISTRATION SERVICES FOR 

RECONSTRUCT PARALLEL TAXIWAY A PROJECT  
 

McFarland-Johnson, Inc. (CONSULTANT) shall provide the following professional services to 
Chemung County (SPONSOR) including administrative and full-time resident inspection services 
during the Construction Phase of the above project at the Elmira Corning Regional Airport. The 
project will be constructed by the SPONSOR with grant assistance from the Federal Aviation 
Administration (FAA) Airport Improvement Program (AIP), and the State of New York 
Department of Transportation.  

The project will include the reconstruction of a 1,100 feet long section of Parallel Taxiway A 
between Taxiway A2 and the newer section of Taxiway A that extends to the Runway 24 Threshold 
at the Elmira Corning Regional Airport. Additional project considerations will include: 
 

 Reconstruction of a portion of Taxiway J from the Taxiway A intersection back to the 
existing non-movement pavement marking.  

 Storm water drainage improvements will be limited to treating water quality. 
 Taxiway edge lighting and signage will not be addressed under this project. 

 
The construction activity will be phased to minimize impacts on airport operations. The 
construction phasing includes a single phase and work area to complete the project while 
facilitating access for aircraft to the runways and apron facilities located adjacent to the work. It is 
anticipated that a full-time staff of one Resident Engineer will be required during the work period, 
with an additional full-time staff of a Senior Inspector during asphalt paving operations to be 
provided by a subconsultant, Hunt E-A-S.  A Geotechnical Subconsultant will also be required to 
perform Quality Assurance (QA) laboratory and field testing. A Surveying subconsultant will be 
employed to provide an as-built survey of the project. The cost of the construction contract, based 
on estimates, is $1.36 Million.  
 
Professional services to be provided by the CONSULTANT shall include the following: 
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Elmira Corning Regional Airport   
Reconstruct Parallel Taxiway A 
Construction Administration – Scope of Services 2 

A. ADMINISTRATION/PROJECT MANAGEMENT: 

Services provided for under this phase typically include: 

1. Consultation: CONSULTANT shall provide advice to the SPONSOR during 
construction, including the holding of a pre-construction conference and final 
inspection conference as required by the FAA. 

2. Site Visits:  CONSULTANT’s Project Manager/Project Engineer shall make visits 
to the site at intervals appropriate to the various stages of construction, as 
CONSULTANT deems necessary, in order to observe the progress and adherence 
to the Contract Documents of the various aspects of the CONTRACTOR(s)’ work. 
It is anticipated that the Project Manager/Project Engineer will visit the site a 
minimum of one visit per week during the construction period. 

3. Shop Drawings: CONSULTANT shall review and take other appropriate action 
with respect to Shop Drawings, Material Submittals, Samples and other data which 
the CONTRACTOR(s) are required to submit, but only for conformance with the 
information given in the Contract Documents and compatibility with the design 
concept of the completed Project as a function of the whole as indicated in the 
Contract Documents.  Such reviews and approvals or other action shall not extend 
to means, methods, techniques, sequences, or procedures of construction or to 
safety precautions and programs incidental thereto. 

4. Construction Management Plan: CONSULTANT shall prepare a Construction 
Management Plan in accordance with FAA requirements for the project, including 
identification of key staff, their experience and duties on this project. The plan will 
also identify key material testing requirements for the project and identify how 
these requirements will be addressed, and the parties responsible for the testing 
program.  

5. Grant Administration:  A Grant Administrator will be assigned to the Project. The 
Grant Administrator will assist the SPONSOR with reimbursement requests to the 
funding agency, as well as prepare required project close-out documentation.  The 
project duration requiring this task is estimated to be twelve months.  Grant 
Administration services provided herein apply to the design and construction 
observation phases. 

 

B. CONSTRUCTION OBSERVATION:  

Construction observation services shall be provided by a competent full-time Resident 
Project Representative (RPR), and a competent full-time Inspector familiar with airport 
operations at a facility similar to that of the SPONSOR’s. 
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Elmira Corning Regional Airport   
Reconstruct Parallel Taxiway A 
Construction Administration – Scope of Services 3 

1. Applications for Payment: Based on 1) CONSULTANT’s on-site observations of 
work progress; 2) information provided by the Resident Project Representative; 3) 
review of the applications for payment including the accompanying data and 
schedules: 

a. CONSULTANT shall determine the amounts owing the 
CONTRACTOR(s) and recommend in writing payments to 
CONTRACTOR(s) in such amounts. Such recommendations of payment 
will constitute a representation to the SPONSOR based on such 
observations and review, that the work has progressed to the point indicated, 
and that, to the best of the CONSULTANT’s knowledge, information and 
belief, the quality of such work is generally in accordance with the Contract 
Documents (subject to an evaluation of such work as to a functioning whole 
prior to, or upon, Substantial Completion, to the results of any subsequent 
tests called for in the Contract Documents and to any other qualifications 
stated in the recommendation). In the case of unit price work, 
CONSULTANT’s recommendations of payment will include final 
determinations of quantities and classifications of such work (subject to any 
subsequent adjustments allowed by the Contract Documents). 

b. By recommending any payment, CONSULTANT will not thereby be 
deemed to have represented that exhaustive, continuous or detailed reviews 
or examination have been made by CONSULTANT to check the quality or 
quantity of CONTRACTOR(s) work as it is furnished and performed 
beyond the responsibilities specifically assigned to CONSULTANT in the 
Agreement and the Contract Documents.  CONSULTANT agrees that he 
will exercise reasonable professional judgement in verifying that the 
adherence to the Contract Documents and quantity of the work meets 
requirements of the Contract Documents for which CONSULTANT is 
contractually responsible.  CONSULTANT’s review of 
CONTRACTOR(s)’ work for the purposes of recommending payments will 
not impose on CONSULTANT responsibility to supervise, direct, or control 
such work or for the means, methods, techniques, sequences, direct, or 
procedures of construction or safety precautions or programs incident 
thereto or CONTRACTOR(s) compliance with laws, rules, regulations, 
ordinances, codes, or orders applicable to their furnishing and performing 
the work.  It will also not impose responsibility on CONSULTANT to make 
any examination to ascertain how or for what purpose any CONTRACTOR 
has used the monies paid on account of the Contract Price, or to determine 
that title to any of the work, materials, or equipment has passed to 
SPONSOR free and clear of any lien, claims, security interests, or 
encumbrances, or that there may not be other matters at issue between 
SPONSOR and CONTRACTOR(s) that might affect the amount that should 
be paid. 
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Elmira Corning Regional Airport   
Reconstruct Parallel Taxiway A 
Construction Administration – Scope of Services 4 

2. Resident Inspection:  Provide technical observation of construction by a full-time 
Resident Project Representative (RPR) and supporting staff as required, who will 
also: 

a. Maintain a project record in conformance with the Federal Aviation 
Administration and Manual of Uniform Record Keeping (MURK), adopted 
for use on an Airport Improvement Project, (AIP). 

b. Complete, review, and verify requests for monthly and final payments for 
CONTRACTOR(s). 

c. Assist SPONSOR in preparation of partial and final requests for 
reimbursement for Federal aid. 

d. Prepare, compile, and negotiate change order documentation and 
supplemental agreements with the CONTRACTOR(s) on behalf of the 
SPONSOR.  

e. Conduct weekly project progress meetings on site with all interested parties, 
and coordinate documentation of these meetings.  

f. The CONSULTANT will employ a qualified materials testing firm 
experienced with airfield materials testing including Crushed Aggregate 
Base Course and Hot Mix Bituminous Asphalt Mixtures. The 
CONSULTANT shall assure that all Federal and/or State requirements, as 
applicable to specified materials, are adhered to. 

3. Progress Reports:  Submit weekly progress reports of construction activity and 
problems encountered as required by the SPONSOR, and the Federal Aviation 
Administration. FAA Form 5370-1, “Construction Progress and Inspection Report” 
will be utilized for this purpose. 

4. Contractor(s)’ Completion Documents: CONSULTANT shall receive and review 
maintenance and operating instructions, schedules, guarantees, bonds, and 
certificates of inspection, test and approvals which are to be assembled by 
CONTRACTOR(s). 

5. Inspections: CONSULTANT shall conduct an inspection to determine if the work 
is substantially complete and a final inspection to determine if the work is 
acceptable so that CONSULTANT may recommend, in writing, final payment to 
CONTRACTOR(s) and may give written notice to SPONSOR and the 
CONTRACTOR(s) that the work is acceptable (subject to any conditions therein 
expressed), but any such recommendation and notice will be subject to the 
limitations expressed in this Section “B.l.b.”. 

6. Completion Certificates:  Issue certificates of completion to the SPONSOR and the 
Federal Aviation Administration at the completion of construction. 
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Elmira Corning Regional Airport   
Reconstruct Parallel Taxiway A 
Construction Administration – Scope of Services 5 

7. Limitation of Responsibility: CONSULTANT shall not be responsible for the acts 
or omissions of any CONTRACTOR(s), or of any Subcontractor or supplier, or any 
of the CONTRACTOR(s)’ work, nor shall the CONSULTANT have the 
responsibility to supervise, direct, or control CONTRACTOR(s)’ work or for the 
means, methods, techniques, sequences, or procedures of construction or for the 
safety precautions or safety programs of the CONTRACTOR(s). 

8. Limitations of Authority:  (RPR, Inspector and On-Site Staff) 

a. Shall not authorize any deviation from the Contract Documents or 
substitution of materials or equipment, unless authorized by the 
CONSULTANT. 

b. Shall not exceed limitations of CONSULTANT’s authority as set forth in 
the agreement or the Construction Contract Documents. 

c. Shall not undertake any of the responsibilities of CONTRACTOR, 
subcontractors or CONTRACTOR’s superintendent. 

d. Shall not advise on, issue directions relative to or assume control over any 
aspect of the means, methods, techniques, sequences or procedures of the 
construction unless such advice or directions are specifically required by 
Contract Documents. 

e. Shall not advise on, issue directions regarding or assume control over safety 
precautions and programs in connection with the work. 

f. Shall not accept Shop Drawing or sample submittals from anyone other than 
the CONSULTANT. 

g. Shall not authorize SPONSOR to occupy the Project in whole or in part. 

h. Shall not participate in specialized field or laboratory tests or inspections 
conducted by others except as specifically authorized by CONSULTANT. 

9. Responsibilities/duties of Construction Observation Staff:  In general, the on-site 
project representative and staff are responsible for monitoring construction activity 
on a project and documenting their observations in a formal project record. The 
formal project record for this project will follow the format and guidelines of the 
MURK system adopted for an airport project. 

The formal project record consists of the following entries and duties: 
 
a. CONSULTANT’s Daily Project Diary 

b. Inspector’s Daily Reports 

c. Preparation of FAA Weekly Reports 
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Elmira Corning Regional Airport   
Reconstruct Parallel Taxiway A 
Construction Administration – Scope of Services 6 

d. Prime/Subcontractor Work Summary 

e. Preparation of Material Acceptance Reports 

f. Preparation of Certification and Testing Log Book 

g. Review Subcontractor approval forms 

h. Prepare statement of days charged on a weekly basis 

i. Conduct Wage Rate Interviews with prime and/or subcontractors 
employees 

j. Conduct project meetings with Owner and Contractors 

k. Field measure quantities on a daily basis 

l. Collect and monitor weekly payrolls for Davis Bacon Act Compliance 

m. Review and/or preparation of Periodic Payment Requests 

n. Record deviations from the contract plans for preparation of Record 
Drawings 

o. Preparation and review of Change Orders/Force Account Work 

 
The Resident Project Representative is also responsible for monitoring construction 
activity as it relates to airport operations and coordination of construction activities 
with airport operations staff, including appropriate NOTAMs (Notice to Airmen). 
The construction phasing will require significant nighttime and weekend work over 
the course of the project. 
 

10. Contract Period:   CONSULTANT agrees to provide the services in this phase of 
the Agreement during the construction contract period, which is estimated to be 45 
calendar days starting in the Summer of 2022. Additionally, project initiation, 
administration and project closeout are anticipated to include 60 days prior to the 
notice to proceed and 90 days after project acceptance to complete the project 
records.  

The fee contained in the Exhibit “B” is based on the stated anticipated hours of 
effort. If these hours are exceeded, through no fault of the CONSULTANT, the 
CONSULTANT shall be entitled to additional compensation.   

PROJECT CLOSEOUT: 

1. As-Built Survey: An FAA AGIS as-built survey of the project area in accordance 
with AC 150/1500-18B will not be required. An as-built survey of the project area 
will be completed by a subconsultant to verify the position of the features 
constructed during project.  

2. Record Plans:  Prepare and furnish two (2) hard copies, and one PDF electronic 
version, of the Record Plans for the completed project to the SPONSOR. Copies 
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Elmira Corning Regional Airport   
Reconstruct Parallel Taxiway A 
Construction Administration – Scope of Services 7 

will also be provided to the federal and state funding agencies, if required. The 
record plans must be supplied as a requirement of the contract. These plans will 
show the completed construction per the inspector’s and contractor’s records. They 
are, however, not to be construed as being 100 percent accurate. 

3. Construction Testing and Quality Control Report: Prepare and furnish two (2) 
copies of the final Construction Testing and Quality Control Report for the 
completed project to the SPONSOR. Three (3) copies will also be provided to the 
Federal Aviation Administration, as required. This report will provide a summary 
of the documented results of Quality Control Testing completed over the course of 
the project. 

C. SCHEDULE 

The CONSULTANT agrees to complete the work under this phase of the Agreement in a manner 
satisfactory to the SPONSOR within twelve (12) months after award of a construction contract 
and receipt of an executed copy of this contract from the SPONSOR accompanied by a resolution 
from its governing body authorizing said execution or within such extended periods as agreed to 
by the SPONSOR. 

The CONSULTANT agrees to perform the services during the Construction Observation Portion 
of this agreement during the construction contract period estimated to be as follows:    

 Working Days 

Pre-Construction:  Project Manager:     2 @ 8 hrs. 
    Project Engineer:     5 @ 8 hrs. 
    Resident Engineer     5 @ 8 hrs. 
     
Construction Contract: Project Manager:     3 @ 8 hrs. 

Project Engineer:     6 @ 8 hrs. 
Resident Engineer     45 @ 10 hrs. 
Senior Inspector – Paving (Hunt)   10 @ 10 hrs. 

 
Post Construction:  Project Manager:     1 @ 8 hrs. 
    Project Engineer:     2 @ 8 hrs. 

Resident Engineer     10 @ 8 hrs. 
         
 

 
NOTE: THIS TABULATION DOES NOT INCLUDE ALL EXPECTED EFFORT BY CONSULTANT. 
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EXHIBIT B
ECRA - Reconstruct TW A CA

Chemung County

April 2022

FEE SUMMARY

CONSTRUCTION 
SERVICES

1.  DIRECT TECHNICAL LABOR $39,720.00

2.  ESTIMATED OVERHEAD EXPENSES AND PAYROLL BURDEN $69,510.00
Based on Percentage of Direct Salary Cost
(exclusive of Premium Pay) with the estimated
Percentage being  175.00 %

3.  SUBTOTAL OF ITEMS 1 & 2 $109,230.00

4.   FIXED FEE / PROFIT $16,384.50

5.   DIRECT EXPENSES $4,952.00

6.  SUBCONSULTANT COSTS $14,963.00

Hunt EAS, DPC (P.T. Constr Obs) $9,000
Aubertine & Currier (As-built Survey) $5,963

7.  SUBCONTRACT COSTS $17,949.00

PW Laboratories, Inc (Geotechnical Lab & Field Testing) $17,949

8.  OVERTIME PREMIUM $2,268.00

9.  TOTAL FEE ESTIMATE $165,746.50

10. TOTAL FEE FOR ALL SERVICES $165,747

NOTE: Authorized hours worked in excess of forty per week are subject to a premium time charge
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ECRA - Reconstruct TW A CA

Chemung County

April 2022

McFARLAND-JOHNSON LABOR RATES

DIRECT TECHNICAL LABOR

CURRENT PROJECT 2022
AVG. RATE AVG. RATE MAX. RATE

CLASSIFICATION

Vice President (VP) $93.74 $95.05 $93.74

Division Director/Reg.Div.Director (DD) $81.78 $82.92 $96.26

Senior Project Manager (SPM) $60.00 $60.84 $83.00

Senior Engineer (SE) $45.50 $46.14 $51.20

Junior Engineer/Planner/Envrmntlst (JEP2) $31.67 $32.11 $34.66

Technician Supervisor (TS) $47.98 $48.65 $49.40

Technician (T) $33.01 $33.47 $36.50

Junior Technician (JT) $18.50 $18.76 $18.50

Resident Inspector (RI) $50.00 $50.70 $52.32

Senior Inspector (SI) $41.65 $42.23 $47.62

Inspector (I) $40.04 $40.60 $40.04

Assume Notice to Proceed: 9/1/2022
Design Project Duration (months):

Assume Salary Escalation: 4.0%

Compounded % Work Effective
Year Escalation Factor in year %

2022 1.000 65.0% 65.0%
2023 1.040 35.0% 36.4%
2024 1.082

100.0% 101.4%
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ECRA - Reconstruct TW A CA

Chemung County

April 2022

DIRECT COSTS

Travel Related Costs:

Vehicle Cost Plus Fuel $4,812

Per Diem

Reproduction

CADD Plots

Prints

Photocopies

Photo Costs

Telephone/Fax:

Postage/Delivery $40

Miscellaneous $100

$4,952

$4,952

CONSTRUCTION 
SERVICES
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ECRA - Reconstruct TW A CA

Chemung County

April 2022
ESTIMATED HOURS

HOURS BY CLASSIFICATION
VP DD SPM SE JEP2 TS T JT RI SI I SUM

$95.05 $82.92 $60.84 $46.14 $32.11 $48.65 $33.47 $18.76 $50.70 $42.23 $40.60
PHASE/TASK DESCRIPTION

Administration and Project Management Phase 40 80 32 40 192
BTCONS Consultation 6 12 18
BTSITE Site Visit 12 12 8 32
BTMEET Meetings 12 32 24 68
BTSHOP Shop Drawing / Submittal Review 24 32 8 64
BTADMN Project Management 10 10

Construction Observation Phase 8 450 458
BTPAYM Applications for Payment 8 8
BTINSP Resident Engineer 450 450

Grant Administration / Project Closeout Phase 8 16 4 40 80 148
BTGRNT Grant Administration 40 40
BTCLOT Project Closeout 8 12 64 84
BTRECP Prepare Record Plans 4 4 16 24

Total Hours - Construction Services 48 104 36 40 570 798
Total Labor Cost - Construction Services 2920 4799 1156 1946 28899 39720
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CHEMUNG COUNTY ROUTE SLIP * PERSONNEL REQUISITION

 Resolution authorizing Purchase Agreement with Hillyard, Inc. on behalf of the Elmira Corning Regional
Airport (Ride-on Sweeper)

Resolution #:
Slip Type: CONTRACT
SEQRA status
State Mandated False

Explain action needed or Position requested (justification):
The Director of Aviation, on behalf of the Elmira Corning Regional Airport, is requesting authorization to
purchase a Ride-On Sweeper in the amount of $48,421.41.  This piece of equipment was approved in the
2022 budget and is on NYS Contract.

 Vendor/Provider Hillyard, Inc.    
 Term Total Amount $48,421.41 Prior Amount
 Local Share 5% (PFC's) State Share 5% Federal Share 95% (CARES

Act)
 Project

Budgeted?
Yes Funds are in

Account #
  

CREATION:
Date/Time: Department:
4/12/2022 11:45:26 AM County Executive

APPROVALS:
Date/Time: Approval: Department:
4/12/2022 11:46 AM Approved County Executive
4/13/2022 11:11 AM Approved Budget and Research
4/14/2022 1:18 PM Approved Legislature Chairman

ATTACHMENTS:
Name: Description: Type:

 Sweeper_PiggyBack.pdf Sweeper PiggyBack Cover Memo
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CHEMUNG COUNTY ROUTE SLIP * PERSONNEL REQUISITION

 Resolution authorizing Purchase Agreement with Deer & Company and CNH Industries of America,
LLC on behalf of the Elmira Corning Regional Airport (Tractor and Flail)

Resolution #:
Slip Type: CONTRACT
SEQRA status
State Mandated False

Explain action needed or Position requested (justification):
The Director of Aviation, on behalf of the Elmira Corning Regional Airport is requesting authorization to
purchase a John Deere Tractor & Flail.  This cost for both of these pieces are as follows:
Tractor - $75,137.48
Flail - $96,548.00

 Vendor/Provider Deer & Company and CNH
Industries of America, LLC

   

 Term Total Amount $171,685.48 Prior Amount
 Local Share 5% (PFC's) State Share 5% Federal Share 95% (CARES

Act)
 Project

Budgeted?
Yes Funds are in

Account #
  

CREATION:
Date/Time: Department:
4/12/2022 11:28:41 AM County Executive

APPROVALS:
Date/Time: Approval: Department:
4/12/2022 11:43 AM Approved County Executive
4/13/2022 11:10 AM Approved Budget and Research
4/14/2022 1:17 PM Approved Legislature Chairman

ATTACHMENTS:
Name: Description: Type:

Tractor_Excavator_Piggyback.pdf Tractor Excavator Piggyback Cover Memo
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CHEMUNG COUNTY ROUTE SLIP * PERSONNEL REQUISITION

 Resolution authorizing Purchase Agreement with Deer & Company and CNH Industries of America,
LLC on behalf of the  Elmira Corning Regional Airport (Case Excavator)

Resolution #:
Slip Type: CONTRACT
SEQRA status
State Mandated False

Explain action needed or Position requested (justification):
The Director of Aviation, on behalf of the Elmira Corning Regional Airport is requesting authorization to
purchase a Case Excavator in the amount of $88,000.00.  This piece of equipment was approved in the
2022 budget and is on NYS Contract.

 Vendor/Provider Deer & Company and CNH
Industries of America, LLC

   

 Term Total Amount $88,000 Prior Amount
 Local Share 5% (PFC's) State Share 5% Federal Share 90% (CARES

Act)
 Project

Budgeted?
Yes Funds are in

Account #
  

CREATION:
Date/Time: Department:
4/12/2022 11:52:39 AM County Executive

APPROVALS:
Date/Time: Approval: Department:
4/12/2022 11:54 AM Approved County Executive
4/13/2022 11:10 AM Approved Budget and Research
4/14/2022 1:16 PM Approved Legislature Chairman

ATTACHMENTS:
Name: Description: Type:

Tractor_Excavator_Piggyback.pdf Tractor Excavator Piggyback Cover Memo
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CHEMUNG COUNTY ROUTE SLIP * PERSONNEL REQUISITION

 Tom Freeman, Director of Aviation - Update on ECRA

Resolution #:
Slip Type: OTHER
SEQRA status
State Mandated False

Explain action needed or Position requested (justification):

CREATION:
Date/Time: Department:
4/7/2022 12:35:10 PM

APPROVALS:
Date/Time: Approval: Department:

ATTACHMENTS:
Name: Description: Type:
No Attachments Available
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